
Village of Fonda 
Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 

April 14, 2025, Regular Meeting 

 

Date: April 14, 2025  
Time: Opened at 6:29pm 
Location: 8 E. Main St, Fonda, NY 12068 
Meeting Called to Order By: Mayor Peeler 

 

ATTENDANCE 

Board of Trustees: 

Name Present Remote Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    

Scott Sprague, Trustee    

Tim Healey, Trustee, Deputy Mayor    

Bill Peeler, Mayor    

Staff/Officials Present: 

Name Present Remote Absent 

Christine Kearns, Clerk-Treasure    

Chris Weaver, Street & Water Commissioner    

Mike Albanese, Village Attorney Arrived at 6:37pm    

Stan Waddle, Code Enforcement    

Beverly Guiffre, Historian    

Public and Guests in Attendance: 

• Chris Dancy, Vaness Fuggit, Pamela Wadsworth, Tonya Bogenschutz, Sal Riggi, Beverly Guiffre, Keira Crahan, 
Gretchen Subik, Linda Bell, Steve Barker, Rich Garnet, Lyle Wadsworth  

• Sign-in sheet attached 

APPROVAL OF PREVIOUS MINUTES 

Motion #2025-1 – To approve the minutes from the March 10, 2025, Regular meeting 

• Motion by: Mayor Peeler, Seconded by: Trustee Healey 

• Vote: Aye – 4, Nay – 0 Abstain – 0, Absent – 1 

• Motion:  Passed  Failed 
Motion #2025-2 – To approve the minutes from the March 24, 2025, Special meeting 

• Motion by: Mayor Peeler, Seconded by: Trustee Sprague 

• Vote: Aye – 4, Nay – 0, Abstain – 0, Absent – 1 

• Motion:  Passed  Failed 
 

OLD BUSINESS 

Motion #25-03 Motion to Rescind Award of Bid #25-01 for Garbage, Trash, and Recycling Services 
 
The Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda hereby rescinds the previous award of Bid #25-01 for the collection and 
removal of garbage, trash, and recyclable materials due to the bidder’s failure to comply with the pricing requirements 
outlined in the Invitation to Bid. 
 
Upon review, it was determined that the bid submitted included conditional pricing adjustments based on fluctuating fuel 
costs and tipping fees. The bid specifications expressly prohibit these conditions, which require all anticipated costs to be 
included in fixed-rate pricing for each year of the contract. 
 
Allowing such conditional increases would result in unpredictable financial exposure for the Village and conflict with the 
intent of a stable, fixed-price agreement. 
 
As such, the bid is deemed nonresponsive, and the Village has reopened the bidding process in accordance with 
procurement requirements under Request for Bid# 25-02. 
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Offered by Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by Trustee Healey 
 
Vote: 
Ayes: 4 
Nays: 0 
Abstain: 0 
Motion Carried 

 
Bid #25-02 for Collection, Removal and Disposal of Garbage, Trash and Recyclable Materials Opening. 

 
Unit Price per 
Month 

Unit Price per 
Month 

Unit Price per 
Month 

Unit Price per 
Month 

Unit Price per 
Month 

  6/1/2025 - 
5/31/2026 

6/1/2026 - 
5/31/2027 

6/1/2027 - 
5/31/2028 

6/1/2028 - 
5/31/2029 

6/1/2029 - 
5/31/2030 

Randy Weaver, Weaver Sanitation $25.15  $25.15  No bid No bid No bid 

County Waste No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 
      

Spring & Fall Dumpster Services Delivery & 
Removal Fee 

Delivery & 
Removal Fee 

Delivery & 
Removal Fee 

Delivery & 
Removal Fee 

Delivery & 
Removal Fee 

  6/1/2025 - 
5/31/2026 

6/1/2026 - 
5/31/2027 

6/1/2027 - 
5/31/2028 

6/1/2028 - 
5/31/2029 

6/1/2029 - 
5/31/2030 

Randy Weaver, Weaver Sanitation $650.00  $650.00  No bid No bid No bid 

County Waste No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

 
RESOLUTION #16-2025 A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE WINNING BID FOR BID #25-02 FOR THE COLLECTION 

AND REMOVAL OF GARBAGE, TRASH, AND RECYCLABLE MATERIALS 

WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda issued a Re-Invitation for Bid #25-02 for the collection and removal of garbage, trash, 
and recyclable materials within the village limits; and 
 
WHEREAS, the bid submission deadline was April 14, 2025, by 2:00 PM, with the bid opening scheduled for the same 
day at 6:30 PM during the Village Board of Trustees meeting; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village received bids in accordance with the specifications outlined in Bid #25-02; and 
 
WHEREAS, after review and evaluation, the Board of Trustees has determined that the bid submitted by Randy Weaver, 
Weaver Sanitation, is the lowest responsible and responsive bid; 
 
Bid Pricing Received from Randy Weaver, Weaver Sanitation, and as attached: 

Annual Period Unit Price per Month 

June 1, 2025 – May 31, 2026 $25.15 

June 1, 2026 – May 31, 2027 $25.15 

June 1, 2027 – May 31, 2028 $___n/a______ 

June 1, 2028 – May 31, 2029 $___n/a______ 

June 1, 2029 – May 31, 2030 $___n/a______ 

 
Spring and Fall Dumpster Services 

Service Period Delivery & Removal Fee 

Spring and Fall 2025 $650.00 Per Unit 

Spring and Fall 2026 $650.00 Per Unit 

Spring and Fall 2027 $___n/a______ Per Unit 

Spring and Fall 2028 $___n/a______ Per Unit 

Spring and Fall 2029 $___n/a______ Per Unit 

Spring 2030 $___n/a______ Per Unit 



Board of Trustees Minutes Date: April 14, 2025 

 

3 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda hereby accepts the bid 
submitted by Randy Weaver, Weaver Sanitation, for Bid #25-02 for the collection and removal of garbage, trash, and 
recyclable materials; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor is authorized to execute any and all documents necessary to effectuate the 
contract with Randy Weaver, Weaver Sanitation, for the 2 year period 6/1/2025 to 5/31/2027, in accordance with the terms 
of Bid #25-02. 
 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Healey 
 
Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  Yes       No 
 

NEW BUSINESS 

Communications Received 

Received From Description Date 

Erie Canalway Annual Report 2024 Bicentennial 3/10 

NYS DEC NY-Alert Acknowledgement 3/20 

NYS Homes and 
Community Renewal 

Pro-Housing Community certification 3/24 

Frothingham Library Increase in funding request 3/27 

 

Public or Guest Comment 

• Beverly Guiffre, Village Historian, Has been looking for minutes from the old fire department, noticed old banners 
upstairs, would like to take them to preserve them; On May 17th Kateri Shrine will have a 250-year celebration; 
Looking into a grant to digitize the fire department minutes.  

• Gretchen Subik and Linda Bell from Frothingham Library, Came to answer any questions regarding what the 
library does; Have a lot of things happening; Patrons will come in during winter for someplace warm; students 
meet with tutors; patrons use computers; summer programs for kids; craft nights; $100,000 grant because they 
are not ADA accessible, doors are not energy efficient, want to add a conference room. Asked if there were any 
questions. Mayor Peeler asked if they were going to show movies in the park again this year, Linda said yes and 
she will work on a list, Mayor Peeler stated he had a request for more grownup movies and he is looking into 
grants and will look for help for the library. 

Review of Reports 

Mayor’s Report: 

• 18 Broadway has had no action at the property, demolition permit has expired, no communication regarding 
variance. 

• Had conversations with Montgomery County regarding revitalization, Moving Fonda Forward Event went well, 
Drinking Water Source Protection application was submitted for assistance in creating watershed protection plans 
at the reservoir. NYS Canals is working on 100-year lease for waterfront property, possibility of sale of property. 
Wants to start a conversation with CSX and recommend they move the office out of the village. FFJWWTP Board 
needs a chairperson, immediate need for improvements at the plant of approximately $3-6 million. 

Department Reports: 

• All department reports were submitted in writing and are attached to these minutes. 
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• Any verbal clarifications or Board Q&A are noted below: 

o DPW – Maintenance to be done on the Solar Bee on May 13, 2025. Looking for a better way to maintain 
the face of the dam, had demonstration of a remote controlled electric mower for slopes, approximately 
$40,000, hoping to use CHiPS money. 

Financials: 

• Financial reports were provided separately to the Board before the meeting. 

Motion #2025-5 Audit of Bills pre-approved, by Motion Mayor Peeler, Seconded by Trustee Healey, with all in favor   

  General Water Sewer Total 

Pay #41 3/14 7,038.70  2,222.84  72.83  9,334.37  

ss med eft 3/14 538.46  170.05  5.58  714.09  

National Grid 2,690.37  
  

2,690.37  

Verizon Wireless (3.66) 80.08  
 

76.42  

Frontier 
 

114.41  
 

114.41  

USPS 73.00  146.00  146.00  365.00  

Pay #42 3/21 2,508.22  2,109.22  72.83  4,690.27  

ss med eft 3/21 191.88  161.36  5.57  358.81  

Pay #43 3/28 2,559.67  2,068.20  72.83  4,700.70  

ss med eft 3/28 195.81  158.22  5.57  359.60  

National Grid 
 

234.98  
 

234.98  

CDPHP 2,278.37  2,278.36  2,278.36  6,835.09  

Charter Comm 370.00  
  

370.00  

Elan Financial - NBT CC 137.00  
  

137.00  

National Grid  1,264.83  2,519.34  
 

3,784.17  

Pay #44 4/4 2,628.20  2,073.59  72.83  4,774.62  

ss med eft 4/4 201.06  158.63  5.59  365.28  

Pay #45 4/11 2,123.06  2,263.42  72.83  4,459.31  

ss med eft 4/11 162.41  173.15  5.55  341.11  

 
Motion #2025-6 Abstract #11 Motion by Mayor Peeler, Seconded by Trustee Sprague, with all in favor 

General Water Sewer Total 

12,829.85 9,775.88 0.00 22,605.73 

 
Motion #2025-7 Change of Wording on Water/Sewer Bills Regarding Arrear Relevied to Village Tax Bills 
Motion by Mayor Peeler, Seconded by Trustee Klim with all in favor 
Change the wording on the water/sewer bills to read “Arrears from the previous calendar year remaining unpaid after May 
1st will be relevied to the Village Property Tax Bill” 
 

Motion #2025-4 Motion Authorizing the Mayor to Seek Software Solutions for Public Engagement, Transparency, and 
Internal Department Management 

The Village of Fonda Board of Trustees authorizes the Mayor to research and seek information, proposals, and pricing for 
software platforms that support improved public engagement, enhanced transparency, and efficient communication of 
general, emergency, and reportable information between the Village and the public. These platforms may include mobile 
and web-based alerts, service notifications, and two-way reporting for residents. 

Additionally, the Mayor is authorized to explore software systems integrated with the above or separate that provide tools 
for internal department management, workflow coordination, and task tracking to improve operational efficiency across 
Village functions. 

This motion assesses options aligning with the Village’s transparency, responsiveness, and effective service delivery 
goals. 

Motion by: Mayor Peeler 

Motion Seconded by Trustee Sprague 

Vote: 
Ayes: 4 
Nays: 0 
Abstain: 0 
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Motion Carried 

Gretchen Subik and Linda Bell left the meeting, 7:30pm 

Resolution #13-2025 A Resolution Authorizing Engagement of Legal Counsel for Environmental Interests Offered by 
Mayor Peeler 

Motion by Trustee Healey, Seconded by Trustee Sprague to table Resolution #13-2025 until after executive session. Aye-
4, Nay-0 

Resolution #14-2025 A Resolution of the Village of Fonda Adopting Montgomery County Multi-Jurisdiction Natural 
Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024 
 
WHEREAS, the Village Board of the Village of Fonda recognizes the ongoing threat that natural hazards pose to the 
safety, well-being, and property of residents and businesses within the Village of Fonda; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda, in collaboration with Montgomery County and other local jurisdictions, has participated 
in the preparation of the Montgomery County Multi-Jurisdiction Natural Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024, developed in 
accordance with the federal Disaster Mitigation Act of 2000; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Montgomery County Multi-Jurisdiction Natural Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024 identifies specific mitigation 
strategies, goals, and actions designed to reduce or eliminate long-term risks to people and property from the impacts of 
future natural hazards and disasters within the Village of Fonda and surrounding communities; and 
 
WHEREAS, formal adoption of this plan demonstrates the Village of Fonda’s continued commitment to hazard mitigation 
planning and to the proactive pursuit of measures that protect lives, property, infrastructure, and the local economy from 
the effects of future hazard events; 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Village Board of the Village of Fonda hereby adopts the Montgomery 
County Multi-Jurisdiction Natural Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024 as the official multi-hazard mitigation plan of the Village of  
Fonda. 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that while the plan may be updated or amended as required by FEMA or state review 
processes, such edits shall not require re-adoption by the Village of Fonda unless substantial changes are made. This 
resolution applies only to this specific plan adoption and does not exempt the Village from the required plan update 
process every five (5) years. 
 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Klim 
 
Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  Yes  No 
 
Resolution #15-2025 A Resolution Authorizing the Village of Fonda to Apply for Funding Under The Municipal 
Parks and Recreation Grant Program 
WHEREAS, the New York State Office of Parks, Recreation and Historic Preservation (OPRHP) is accepting applications 
for the Municipal Parks and Recreation (MPR) Grant Program, funded by the Clean Water, Clean Air, and Green Jobs 
Environmental Bond Act of 2022; and 
 
WHEREAS, the MPR Grant Program provides funding for the development and improvement of municipal parks and 
recreational facilities, with a maximum grant award of $1,000,000 and a required 10% local match; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda is eligible to apply for this grant and intends to apply by the May 2, 2025, deadline; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village is committed to providing the required 10% matching funds, which may include cash, in-kind 
services, or other eligible contributions as defined by the program guidelines; 
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NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda hereby authorizes the 
submission of an application to the MPR Grant Program for funding up to $1,000,000; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Village commits to providing the required 10% matching funds and to complying 
with all applicable federal, state, and local regulations and requirements associated with the grant; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor is authorized to execute all necessary documents and take any actions 
needed to effectuate the application and administration of the grant. 
 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Healey 
 
Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  X  Yes  ___ No 
 
Resolution #17-2025 Resolution Authorizing the Public Sale of a 2017 Ford Pickup Truck with Attached 
Equipment 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda owns a surplus 2017 Ford Pickup Truck with an attached sander and plow, no longer 
required for active service by the Department of Public Works; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Street and Water Commissioner and the Mayor have reviewed the condition and operational viability of 
the vehicle and related equipment and recommend its sale through public bid; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees has determined it is in the best interest of the Village to offer this equipment for sale to 
the public and recover a fair market return; 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda authorizes the public sale of 
the following surplus vehicle and equipment: 
2017 Ford Pickup Truck 
VIN: 1FTRF3B66HEB93245 
Mileage: 25,532 
Additional Equipment: Fisher 9’6” XV2 plow, 2006 Swenson sander spreader, back rack and warning lights  
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Street and Water Commissioner, in coordination with the Property Control 
Manager, is hereby authorized to advertise the vehicle and equipment for sale, receive public bids, and facilitate the 
transfer of ownership to the highest responsible bidder meeting the following condition: 

• Minimum Acceptable Bid: $35,000.00 USD 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor shall be authorized to sign any necessary transfer documents on behalf of 
the Village upon successful sale completion. 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Sprague 
 
Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  Yes       No 
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Resolution #18-2025 Resolution Establishing Mandatory Use of Official Village Email, Data Storage Systems, and 
Assigned Digital Devices for Board Members 
 
WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda has adopted data storage and security policies to ensure that all records, 
correspondence, and digital files are preserved, protected, and maintained in accordance with New York State laws and 
best practices for public records management; and 
 
WHEREAS, the use of personal email accounts and unauthorized storage systems poses risks to the integrity, 
accessibility, and security of Village records and official communications; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees seeks to increase operational efficiency, reduce paper waste, and enhance productivity 
through the use of digital meeting documents and centralized systems; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Village has acquired digital tablets (pads) for the use of Board members, to be configured with official 
Village email accounts and access to the secure Microsoft 365 data storage platform in accordance with the Village's  
adopted policies; 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that all members of the Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda shall utilize 
their assigned official Village email accounts and the secure Village-approved data storage system for all Village-related 
communications and records; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that all members of the Board shall use the assigned digital tablets for accessing meeting 
materials, emails, and other Village business once the devices have been configured and made operational by the Village 
IT representative; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the use of these tablets is mandatory for Board members and is optional at the 
discretion of the Mayor for other Village officials who possess Village-owned laptops or digital devices; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that each Board member is responsible for the care, maintenance, and security of the 
assigned device and for complying with the Village’s digital communication and data storage policies; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this resolution supports the Village’s goals of improving record retention, increasing 
data security, reducing paper waste, and enhancing meeting productivity. 
 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Klim 
 
Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  Yes       No 
 
Decision regarding Fire Department banners to be made at the next meeting. 
FFHS Participation in Government Student Keira Crahan asked what the plans were for paving Hogans Alley. Mayor 
Peeler stated that new water lines are scheduled to be installed this summer and paving will be done then. 
 

MOTIONS 

Summary of Motions Presented: 

Motion # Description 

2025-4 
Motion Authorizing the Mayor to Seek Software Solutions for Public Engagement, Transparency, and 
Internal Department Management 

2025-5 Audit of Bills, pre-approved 

2025-6 Abstract #11 

2025-7 Change of Wording on Water/Sewer Bills Regarding Arrears Relevied to Village Tax Bills 

2025-8 Motion to Place Resolution #13-2025 Back on the Table 
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Verbal Vote Results: 

Motion # Made By Seconded By Vote (A/N/AB) Result 

2025-4 Mayor Peeler Trustee Sprague Ayes-4, Nay-0 Carried 

2025-5 Mayor Peeler Trustee Healey Ayes-4, Nay-0 Carried 

2025-6 Mayor Peeler Trustee Sprague Ayes-4, Nay-0 Carried 

2025-7 Mayor Peeler Trustee Klim Ayes-4, Nay-0 Carried 

2025-8 Mayor Peeler Trustee Sprague Ayes-4, Nay-0 Carried 

RESOLUTIONS 

Summary of Resolutions Presented: 

Resolution # Offered By Second By Title/Description 

13-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Healey 
A Resolution Authorizing Engagement of Legal Counsel for 
Environmental Interests 

14-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Klim 
A Resolution of the Village of Fonda Adopting the Montgomery 
County Multi-Jurisdiction Natural Hazard Mitigation Plan 2024 

15-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Healey 
A Resolution Authorizing the Village of Fonda to Apply for Funding 
Under the Municipal Parks and Recreation Grant Program 

16-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Healey 
A Resolution Accepting the Winning Bid for Bid #25-02 for the 
Collection and Removal of Garbage, Trash and Recyclable Materials 

17-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Sprague 
Resolution Authorizing the Public Sale of a 2017 Ford Pickup Truck 
with Attached Equipment 

18-2025 Mayor Peeler Trustee Klim 
Resolution Establishing Mandatory Use of Official Village Email, 
Data Storage Systems, and assigned Digital Devices for Board 
Members 

Roll Call Vote Results: 

Resolution # Bob Klim Lynn Dumar Scott Sprague Tim Healey Mayor Peeler Result 

13-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

14-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

15-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

16-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

17-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

18-2025 Aye Absent Aye Aye Aye Adopted 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 Motion – To enter executive session at 7:48pm to discuss contract negotiation and litigation matter 

 Motion by: Mayor Peeler, Seconded by: Trustee Sprague Vote: Aye-4, Nay-0 

Rest of Public left the meeting at this point. 

 Motion – To exit executive session at 8:34pm to discuss contract negotiation and litigation matter 

 Motion by: Mayor Peeler, Seconded by: Trustee Healey Vote: Aye-4, Nay-0 

 No action was taken 

 Action taken – see Motion #2025-8 above. 

 No Executive Session Held 

 

Motion #2025-8 Motion to Place Resolution #13-2025 Back on the Table offered by Trustee Healey, Seconded by Trustee 
Sprague with all in favor 

Resolution #13-2025 A Resolution Authorizing Engagement of Legal Counsel for Environmental Interests 

WHEREAS, the Village of Fonda is committed to protecting its natural resources, including the integrity of its water supply 
and surrounding environment; and 

WHEREAS, the Village may, from time to time, be required to address matters or concerns involving land use, agricultural 
activity, or other potential impacts to environmental quality or water resources; and 
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WHEREAS, such matters may require legal advice, representation, or negotiation, including confidential issues discussed 
under Executive Session; and 

WHEREAS, the Village has received a proposed engagement letter dated April 11, 2025, from Young/Sommer LLC for 
legal counsel related to such matters; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Trustees of the Village of Fonda hereby authorizes the Mayor 
to execute the engagement letter with Young/Sommer LLC and any future engagement agreements of a similar nature to 
represent the Village in support of environmental protection and water resource management, and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that legal services rendered under this engagement shall be compensated in accordance 
with the terms stated in the agreement and that any actions or communications conducted under this engagement may be 
subject to confidentiality in accordance with Executive Session provisions under New York State Law. 

Motion by: Mayor Peeler 
Seconded by: Trustee Healey 

Roll Call Vote: 

Name Aye Nay Abstain Absent 

Bob Klim, Trustee X    

Lynn Dumar, Trustee    X 

Scott Sprague, Trustee X    

Tim Healey, Trustee X    

Bill Peeler, Mayor X    

Resolution Adopted:  Yes       No 

GENERAL TOPICS DISCUSSED (not noted or outside resolutions or motions) 

• None 

ITEMS REQUESTED BY THE MAYOR TO BE INCLUDED IN THE RECORD 

• None 

ANNOUNCEMENT OF NEXT MEETING 

The next regular meeting of the Village of Fonda Board of Trustees will be held on May 12, 2025, at 6:30pm at 8 E 
Main St, Fonda, NY 12068. 

ADJOURNMENT 

Motion – To adjourn the meeting at 8:37pm 
Motion by: Mayor Peeler, Seconded by: Trustee Sprague 
Vote: Aye – 4, Nay - 0 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
Christine Kearns, Village Clerk 
Approved: May 12, 2025 


